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ORDINANCE 20 22 - 0 8 -11 - O 5 7 3 
APPROVING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING UNIT 
PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL 
COST OF $312,506.00, INCLUDED IN THE RESPECTIVE 
DEPARTMENT'S FY 2022 ADOPTED BUDGET: (A) CASA VERDE 
FARMS, INC., FOR BEDDING PLANTS; (B) MIDTEX OIL, L.P., HAMPEL 
OIL DISTRIBUTORS, INC., AND TEXAS ENTERPRISE, INC., FOR 
ANTIFREEZE COOLANT, AND (C) REECE SUPPLY CO. AND SOUTH 
TEXAS FAUCET PARTS LTD., DBA FAUCET PARTS, FOR PLUMBING 
FIXTURES AND SUPPLIES. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Heritage Crystal-Clean failed to meet the City ' s specifications 
and/or requirements for antifreeze coolant; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves contracts with (A) Casa Verde Farms, Inc. , for bedding 
plants ; (B) Midtex Oil, LP. , Hampel Oil Distributors, Inc. , and Texas Enterprise, Inc., for 
antifreeze coolant; and (C) Reece Supply Co. and South Texas Faucet Parts Ltd ., dba Faucet Parts, 
for plumbing fixtures and supplies ; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year ' s budget 
approved by City Council ; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The following bids and offers to furnish the City with goods and services on an 
annual basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and 
contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and 
endorsements: (A) Casa Verde Farms, Inc ., for bedding plants; (B) Midtex Oil , LP ., Hampel Oil 
Distributors, Inc. , and Texas Enterprise, Inc ., for antifreeze coolant; and (C) Reece Supply Co. and 
South Texas Faucet Parts Ltd. , dba Faucet Parts, for plumbing fixtures and supplies. The bid 
tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I . Copies 
of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance 
Department. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bid submitted by Heritage Crystal-Clean 
failed to meet the City ' s specifications and/or requirements for antifreeze coolant. 

SECTION 3. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders, and payment is 
authorized to the vendors identified herein . All expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal 
Year 2022 budget, and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through their 
terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances . 
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SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immedi ately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 11 th day of August, 2022. 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

Debbie Racca-S ittre , City Clerk 
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8. 

City of San Antonio 

City Council Meeting 
August 11, 2022 

2022-08-11-0573 
Ordinance approving the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an 
estimated annual cost of $312,506.00, included in the respective depattment's FY 2022 Adopted 

Budget: (A) Casa Verde Farms, Inc., for bedding plants; (B) Midtex Oil, LP., Hampel Oil 
Distributors, Inc. , and Texas Enterprise, Inc., for antifreeze coolant; and (C) Reece Supply Co. 

and South Texas Faucet Parts Ltd., dba Faucet Parts, for plumbing fixtures and supplies. [Ben 
GorzeU Jr. , Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Councilmember Rocha Gat·cia moved to Approve on the .Consent Agenda. Counci Im ember 
Courage seconded the motion. The motion canied by the following vote: 

Aye: Nirenberg, Bravo, McKee-Rod1iguez, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, Castillo, Cabello 

Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage, Peny 
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Exhibit I 



City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 

Opened May 18, 2022 NON-LOCAL 
For ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR BEDDING PLANTS Casa Verde Farms. Inc 
6100015156 SMM 7791 FM 482 

Estimated Annual 
Schertz, 

Item Description TX 78132 
Quantity -. . n .,.,4_..,..,~., 

1 Fall-Winter Beddina Plants 

" 4" Pot 14.200 
Number of Pots per Flat (NIA if non-aopllcable l NIA 
Unit Price so 86 
Extended price $12,212 00 

1b 6M Pot 1,700 
Number of Pots per Flat (NIA 1f non-applicable ) NIA 
UnrtPnce $500 
Extended pnce $8,500 00 

,, 1 Gallon 550 
Number of Pots oer Flat (NIA 1f non-aooltcablel NIA 
Unrt Pnce S500 
Extended once $2.750 00 

1d 3 Gallon 250 
Number of Pots oer Flat {NIA 1f non-aoollcablel NIA 
Unit Pnce $1250 
Extended once S3.125 00 

Total fo r lines 1a -1d S26.587 00 

2 Fall-Winter BeddinCI Pl ants - 4 SM Cvclamen Onlv 
2a 4 SM Pot 6,500 

Number of Pots oer Flat fN/A 1f non-aoollcabtel NIA 
Unit Pnce $4 75 
Extended orice $30 875 00 

Total for lines 2a $30,875 00 

l Falt-Winter Bedd1no Plants • Po1ntsetnas Onlv 
la 6" Pot 250 

Number of Pois per Fla! {NIA 1f non-appllcablel NIA 
Unit Price $8 50 
Extended Pnce $2.125 00 

lb 10" Pot 100 
Number or Pots per Flat (NIA 1f non-applicable) NIA 
Unit Price $32 00 
Extended pnce S3 200 00 

Total for lines 3a • 3b $5,325 00 

• Sormo Beddmo Plants/Natrve Plants and Grasses 
•a 4" Pot 17,200 

Number of Pots oer Flat /NIA 1f non-aoohcablel NIA 
Umt Pnce so 86 
Extended once S14 792 00 

" 6" Pot 2 .700 
Number of Pots oer Flat IN/A 11 non-aoollcablel NIA 
UnitPnce $5 50 
Extended once $14 850 00 ., 1 Gallon 2.500 
Number of Pots oer Flat IN/A 1f non-aoolicablel NIA 
Unit Pnce $600 
Extended pnce $15,000 00 

•• 3 Gallon 1,750 
Number of Pots oer Flat IN/A if non-aoohcablel N/A 
UnitPnce $12 50 
Extended once $21 ,875 00 

Total for Lines 4a - 4d $66,517 00 

5 Summer Beddino Plants 
Sa 4" Pot 10 700 

Number of Pots oer Flat IN/A 1f non-aoollcablel NIA 
Unit Pnce $086 
Extended once $9 202 00 

Sb 6" Pot 2 .200 
Number of Pots oer Flat CN/A 1f non-aoollcablel NIA 
Unit Pnce $500 
Extended once $1100000 

Sc 1 Gallon 1.500 
Number of Pots per Flat (NIA 1f non-aopl1cable) NIA 
Unit Pnce S5 00 
Extended orice $7,500 00 

Sd 3 Gallon 1.000 
Number of Pots per Flat (NIA 1f non-applicable ) N/A 
Unit Pnce $12 50 
Extended once $12,500 00 

Total for Lines Sa • Sd $40,202 00 

Pavmenl Terms Ne! 30 

Estimated Total $169 506 00 
Estimated Annual Total $169,506.00 

PteparedbyPt.fchasir,gM8'2022 .... 1 



City of San Antonio Formal Bid Tabulation 

Opened: Februrary 28, 2022 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local 
For: Annual Contra ct for Anti freeze Coolant Midtex Oil, LP Hampel Oil Distributors Texas Enterprise Inc. Cummins Southern Heritage Crystal-Clean Napa Auto Parts Redifuel South Texas Auto Part s 

Inc. dba Golden West Oil Co Plains Co. 

610001 5035 SN 3455 IH 35 South 1245 N West Street 301 a Aniol St 6226 N Interstate 35 2175 Point Blvd, Ste 375 6374 Rit1iman Rd 4230 Binz-Engelman 20475 Hwy 46W Ste 340 

Estimated New Braunfels, Wichita , San Antonio, San Antonio, Elgin, San Antonio , San Antonio, Spring Branch, 
Item Description Annual TX 78132 KS 67203 TX 78219 TX 78218 IL 60123 TX 78218 TX 782 19 TX 78070 

Quantitv (979) 482-6333 (316) 529- 11 62 (210) 222-0866 
NAS 

1 Nitrite Free Bulk 50/50 Prediluted Antif reeze 
4.000 Coolant with Delivery Included 

Unit Price Per Gallon: $6.25 $6.65 $8.42 No Bid S5.97 $11 .58 $11.01 $10.05 
Prompt Pay Discount: 2% 
Price Each with Prompt Pay Discount: $9.85 
Extended Price Per Gallon $25.000.00 $26,600.00 $33,680.00 $23.880.00 $46 .320.00 $44 ,040.00 $40.200.00 
Percentage between lowest responsive bidder 46% 43% 
and local bid 
Price Differential $21 ,320.00 $19,040.00 
Manufacturer Shell PATRIOT Old World Crystal Clean Peak Old World Industries, Chevron 

LLC./Peak 
Product Name: Rotella ELC N/F 50/50 NF ELC 50/50 Peak Final Charge Heavy Duty Global Antifreeze/Coolant Final Charge Global DELO XLC 

Global 50/50 Extended Life , Nitrite Antifreeze/Coolant 
Free OAT. bulk 

Part Number: 500009280 999999 FXAB58 234 FXAB58 690825050HF0812 227076BULK 

2 Nitrite Free 50/50 Prediluted Anti freeze 
Coolant in 55-gallon drums w ith delivery 50 
included 
Unit Price Per Drum $479.49 $401 .25 $464.00 $575.25 $398.25 No Bid $640.20 $594.14 
Prompt Pay Discount 2% 
Price Each with Prompt Pay Discount: $582.26 
Extended Price Per Drum: !23.974.50 $20.062.50 $23,200.00 $28 ,762.50 $19,912.50 $32,010.00 $29.707.00 
Percentage between lowest responsive bidder 30% 37% 
and local bid 
Price Differential $3.137 .50 $8 ,700.00 $1 1,947.50 
Manufacturer Shell PATRIOT Old World Valvoline Crystal Clean Old World Industries, Chevron 

LLC/Peak 
Product Name Rotella ELC N/F 50/50 NF ELC 50/50 Peak Final Charge 50/50 Zerex Heavy Duty Global Final Charge Global DELO XLC 

Extended Life , Nitrite Anti freeze/Coolant 
Free OAT, Drum 

Part Number: 550041 811 999999 FXAB57 846438 234A 690825050HF0810 227076 55G 

3 Nitrite Free 50150 Predi luted Anti freeze 
Coolant in 1-gatlon jugs with delivery included 2,000 

Unit Price Per Jug $1 1.66 $9.85 $8.59 $10.69 NO BID No Bid $11 .99 $10.99 
Prompt Pay Discount 2% 
Price Each with Prompt Pay Discount $10.77 
Extended Price Per Jug $23.320.00 $19,700.00 $17.180.00 $21 ,380.00 $23,980.00 $21,980.00 
Percentage between lowest responsive bidder 28% 20% 28% 
and local bid 
Price Differential $3.40 $4 ,200 $6.800 
Manufacturer Shell PEAK Old World Valvotine Old World Industries, Chevron 

LLC./Peak 
Product Name Rotella ELC N/F 50/50 ELC NF 50/50 Peak Final Charge 50/50 Zerex Final Charge Global DELO XLC 

Antofreeze/Coolant 
Part Number 550041810 999999 FXAB53 846437 690825050NF0807 2270761G 

4 Deleted 

5 Deleted 

6 Deleted 

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2%, 10 days 

Estimated Annual Award $72,294.50 $66,362.50 $74,060.00 $50,142.50 $43 ,792.50 $46,320.00 $100,030.00 $91 .887.00 
Estimated Annual Award $25 ,000.00 $20,062.50 $17 ,180.00 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 4, 2022 
For: Annual Contract for Plumbing Fixtures and Parts for San Antonio Airport System Local Local 

Reece Supply AKA Morrison Supply SouthTexas Faucet Parts Ltd dba Faucet 
Parts 

6100014970 LS 10130 Jones Maltsberger 1109 Fresno Dr 

Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio, 
Item Annual TX, 78216 TX, 78201 

Description Quantity 210-344-4436 210-733-3583 

A Delete 

A1 Zurn Lav Fct Aqua-Fit Bat Powered 1 Hole LF CP 10 
Model# Z6950-XL-S 
Unit Price $307.94 294.38 
Extended Price $3,079.40 $2.943.80 
Product# Z6950-XL-S Z6950-XL-S 
Product Name Zurn Battery Faucet Zurn Faucet 

A2 Zurn Behive Strainer 15 
Model # Z5978-FTR 
Unit Price $46.87 $46.88 
Extended Price $703.05 $703.20 
Product# Z5978-FTR Z5978-FTR 
Product Name Beehive Strainer Zurn Strainer 

A3 Zurn Omni-FloTM Back Spud Urinal 0.125 gpf to 1.0 gpf 10 
Model # Z5765-U 

Unit Price $192.50 $312.50 
Extended Price $1 ,925.00 $3,125.00 
Product# Z5765-U Z5765-U 
Product Name Back Spud Urinal Zurn Urinal 

A4 Zurn • HET Concealed, Wall Hung Ecovantage® Flush Valve Toilet with 10 
ZurnSHIELDTM Glaze 
Model# Z5617-BWL 
Unit Price $134.70 $151 .25 
Extended Price $1 ,347.00 $1 .512.50 
Product# Z5617-BWL Z5617-BWL 
Product Name HET Concealed Toilet Zurn Toilet 

A5 Zurn Aqua-Sense Hardwire Powered Faucet 10 
Model# Z6915-XL-CWB 
Unit Price $276.47 $254.38 
Extended Price $2,764.70 $2.543.80 
Product# Z6915-X-CWB Z6915-XL-CWB 
Product Name Aqua Sense Faucet Zurn Faucet 

A6 Zurn• AquaSense AVTM ZEMS Series-Automatic Systems Sensor-Operated 10 
AquaVantage Flushometer - Water closet 
Model# ZEMS6152AV 
Unit Price $409.38 $397.60 
Extended Price $4,093.80 $3.976 00 
Product# ZEMS6152 Av ZEMS6152 
Product Name Aqua Flushometer Closet Zurn Flush Valve 

A7 Zurn •• AquaSense AVTM ZEMS Series-Automatic Systems Sensor-Operated 10 
AquaVantage Flushometer - Urinal 
Model# ZEMS6195AV 
Unit Price $409.38 $611 .57 
Extended Price $4.093.80 $6,115.70 
Product# ZEMS6195Av ZEMS6159 
Product Name Aqua Urinal Flushometer Zurn Flush Valve 

A1 -7 SUBTOTAL $18,006.75 $20.920.00 

B Delete 

B1 Spears 3x20ft PVC SCH40 Pipe 2 
Model # PD-400-30 
Unit Price $21 .24 NO BID 
Extended Price $42.48 
Product# PD-400-30 
Product Name Sch 40 pipe 

B2 Spears 3 CPVC LW C/O ADPT W/ Plug SPGXFIP 10 
Model# P105X-030 
Unit Price $43.48 NO BID 

Extended Price $434.80 

Product# P105X-030 

Product Name Cpvc Adapter pluQ 

B3 Spears 3 PVC DWV Combo WYE 1 /8 Bend HXHXH Model # P501-030 2 

Unit Price $136.04 NO BID 

Extended Price $272.08 

Product# P501-030 
Product Name Combo Wye 

B1 -3 SUBTOTAL $749 36 NOBID 

1/4 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 4, 2022 
For: Annual Contract for Plumbing Fixtures and Parts for San Antonio Airport System Local Local 

Reece Supply AKA Morrison Supply SouthTexas Faucet Parts Lid dba Faucet 
Parts 

6100014970 LS 10130 Jones Maltsberger 1109 Fresno Dr 

Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio, 
Item Annual TX, 78216 TX, 78201 

Description Quantity 210-344-4436 210-733-3583 

C Delete 

C1 1/2" X 1429" Blue PTFE Thread Sealing Tape 20 
Model # 70885 
Unit Price $3.13 $3.23 
Extended Price $62.60 $64.60 
Product# 70885 Millrose 70885 
Product Name Blue PTFE Tape Millrose Tape 

C2 3/4" X 1429" Blue PTFE Thread Sealing Tape 20 
Model # 70886 
Unit Price $4.26 $4.40 
Extended Price $85.20 $88.00 
Product# 70886 Millrose 70886 
Product Name Blue PTFE Tape MiHrose Tape 

C1-2 SUBTOTAL $147 .80 $152 .60 

D Delete 

D1 13/16 X 1-5/8" X 10 Ft. Elongated Hole, Single Channel , Pre-Galvanized Carbon Steel 200 
Model# AS500-EH 2400104705 

Unit Price $1 .22 NO BID 
Extended Price $244.00 
Product# AS500-EH 
Product Name Galvanized Steel Hanger 

D2 1-5/8" X 1-5/8" X 10 Ft. Elongated Hole, Single Channel , Pre-Galvanized Carbon Steel 200 
Model# AS200-EH 2400101305 

Unit Price $5.08 NO BID 
Extended Price $1 ,016.00 
Product# AS200-EH 
Product Name Galvanized Steel HanAer 

D3 3/8" X 1" Hex Head Cap Screw, Mild Steel 70 
Model # 2400250144 

Unit Price $0.45 NO BID 
Extended Price $31 .50 
Product# 2400250144 
Product Name Hex Cap Screw 

D1 -3 SUBTOTAL $1 ,291 .50 NO BID 

E Delete 

E1 3/8 Plated Steel Hex Nut 300 
Model # 19572 
Unit Price $0.26 NO BID 
Extended Price $78.00 
Product# 19572 
Product Name Steel hex nut 

E2 3/8 Plated Flat Round Washer 300 
Model# 20007 

Unit Price $0.26 NO BID 
Extended Price $78.00 
Product# 20007 
Product Name Flat washer 

E1-2 SUBTOTAL $156 00 NO BID 

F Woodford, Or Equal 

Other Items % Markup Above Contractors Cost NO BID 25% 
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Woodford 

Specified Items 

F1 ¼ff Chrome Plated Freezeless Wall Faucet - 3" Wall Thickness, Handwheel, FPT x 10 
MHT, 125 psi 
Model # 24 24P3/4-MH 
Unit Price $5308 $51 .53 
Extended Price $530.80 $515.30 
Product# 24P3/4-MH Woodford 24P3/4-MH 
Product Name 3/4 W all faucet Woodford Faucet 

F2 ½" Chrome Plated Freezeless Wall Faucet - 3" Wall Thickness, Handwheel, FPTx 10 
MHT, 125 psi 
Model# 24 24P1/2-MH 
Unit Price $5308 $53.53 
Extended Price $530.80 $535.30 
Product# 24P1/2-MH Woodford 24P1/2-MH 
Product Name 1/2 Wall faucet Woodford Faucet 

F1 -2 SUBTOTAL $1 061 .60 $1 .050 6e 4 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 4, 2022 
For: Annual Contract for Plumbing Fixtures and Parts for San Antonio Airport System Local Local 

Reece Supply AKA Morrison Supply SouthTexas Faucet Parts Ltd dba Faucet 
Parts 

6100014970 LS 10130 Jones Maltsberger 1109 Fresno Dr 

Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio, 
Item Annual TX, 78216 TX, 78201 

Description Quantity 210-344-4436 210-733-3583 

G Delete 

G1 3" Stainless Steel DWV Heavy Duty Straight Coupling - Husky No Hub 10 
Model # 2000 2008 
Unit Price $9.20 $9.51 
Extended Price $92.00 $95.10 
Product# 2000-2~~: Everflow 15300 
Product Name 3" Steel coupli Everflow Coupling 

G2 2" Stainless Steel DWV Heavy Duty Stra ight Coupling - Husky No Hub 10 
Model# 2000 2006 
Unit Price 

$7:~l 

$7.47 
Extended Price $79. $74.70 
Product# 2000-20 Everflow 15200 
Product Name 2" Steel couplin1 Everflow CouplinQ 

G3 4" Stainless Steel DWV Heavy Duty Straight Coupling - Husky No Hub 10 
Model# 2000 2010 
Unit Price $10.71 $11 .76 
Extended Price $107.10 $117.60 
Product# 2000-2010 Everflow 15400 
Product Name 4" Steel couplinQ Everflow CouplinQ 

G1 -3 SUBTOTAL <?7R an $287.40 

H Ridgid, Or Equal 

Other Items % Markup Above Contractor's Cost NOBID 10% 
Product Identification (Manufacturer) RidQid 

Specified Items 

H1 K-50 Sectional Sewer Machine 10 
Model # K50- 58920 
Unit Price $1 ,041 .36 $1 ,048.52 
Extended Price $10,413.60 $10,485.20 
Product# 50- 58920 58920 
Product Name Sewer machine RidQid K-50 

H2 K60 Sectional Sewer Machine 10 
Model# K60SP-66492 
Unit Price $1 ,764.63 $1 ,638.75 
Extended Price $17 ,646.30 $16,387 .50 
Product# K60SP-66492 66492 
Product Name Sewer machine RidQe K-60 

H3 Pipe Stand Ball Transfer Head 2 
Model # BTH-9 37997 

Unit Price $170.28 $158.26 
Extended Price $340.56 $316.52 
Product# BTH-9 37997 37997 

Product Name Ball Transfer Head RidQid Ball 

H4 Measuring Tape 10 
Model # 76822 
Unit Price N/A $37.25 

Extended Price $372 .50 

Product# 76822 

Product Name RidiQ MeasurinQ tape 

HS V-Head Pipe Stand 2 
Model# VF-99 22168 
Unit Price $95.12 $104.05 

Extended Price $190.24 $208.10 

Product# VF-99 22168 22168 

Product Name V Pipe stand RidQid 

H1 -5 SUBTOTAL $28,590.70 i27 769.82 

I Delete 

11 G2 Optima Plus 1.28 GPF Water Closet Flushometer 10 
Model # 8111 3250289 
Unit Price $443.98 $482.08 

Extended Price $4,439.80 $4,820.80 

Product# 3250289 Sloan 3250289 

Product Name G2 Water closet Sloan Flushvalve 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 4, 2022 
For: Annual Contract for Plumbing Fixtures and Parts for San Antonio Airport System Local Local 

Reece Supply AKA Morrison Supply SouthTexas Faucet Parts Ltd dba Faucet 
Parts 

6100014970 LS 10130 Jones Maltsberger 1109 Fresno Dr 

Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio, 
Item Annual TX, 78216 TX , 78201 

Description Quantity 210-344-4436 210-733-3583 

12 Sloan EAF6A Sensor ASM Hardwire W/O Click (IQ ) 10 
Model# 0335004 
Unit Price $266.92 $280,96 
Extended Price $2,669.20 $2,809.60 
Product# 0335004 Sloan 0235004 
Product Name EAFGA Sensor Sloan Sensor 

13 Sloan 111-1.28 ES-S TMO Water Closet Sensor Flushometer 10 
Model # 3770035 
Unit Price $381 .25 $381 .25 
Extended Price $3,812.50 $3,812.50 
Product# 3770035 Sloan 3770035 
Product Name 111 Closet sensor Sloan Flushvalve 

14 Sloan 186-0.5 ES-S TMO Urinal Sensor Flushometer 10 
Model # 3772648 
Unit Price $381 .25 $381 .25 
Extended Price $3,812.50 $3,812.50 
Product# 3772648 Sloan 3772648 
Product Name 186 Urinal sensor Sloan Flushvalve 

15 Sloan EAF100-LT-ISM CP ELECT FCT 0.5 GPM (IQ)) 10 
Model# 3335140 
Unit Price $554 06 $583.22 
Extended Price $5,540,60 $5,832.20 
Product# 3335140 Sloan 3335140 
Product Name EAF 100-LT Sloan Faucet 

16 Sloan Solenoid-Faucet 40 
Model# 335001 
Unit Price $109,31 $118,78 
Extended Price $4,372.40 $4,751 .20 
Product# EAF 2 Faucet 3335001 Sloan 335001 
Product Name EAF 2 Solenoid Sloan Solenoid 

17 Sloan EL 1218A Repair Kit-Solenoid Actuator 50 
Model # 3305043 
Unit Price $26,00 $25.15 
Extended Price $1 ,300.00 $1 ,257.50 
Product# 3305043 Sloan 3305043 
Product Name EL 1218A Repair Kit Sloan Actuator 

11-7 SUBTOTAL $25,947.00 $27 ,096.30 

J Delete 

J1 3", 125/800 Lb, Electrogalvanized, Low Carbon Steel , 2-Piece, Strut to Pipe Clamp 10 
Model# S2009AEG 

Unit Price $0,86 NO BID 
Extended Price $8,60 
Product# S2009AEG 
Product Name 3" Strut Pipe Clamp 

J2 ¾", 400 Lb, Electrogalvanized, Low Carbon Steel , Pipe to Strut, Strut Clamp 50 
Model# 2003 S2003AEG 
Unit Price $0.43 NO BID 
Extended Price $21 ,50 
Product# 2003 AEG 
Product Name 3/4 Strut Clamp 

J1-2 SUBTOTAL $30 10 NO BID 

Payment Terms Net30 Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $76 259.71 $77 276,72 
Estimated Annual Award $46 607,41 $28 820,42 
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